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August 26, 2009
Mr. Lee Otis Burton
President
American Custom Mfg Co.,Inc.
P.O. Box 3630
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Dear Mr. Burton:

The Jacksonville Aviation Authority pAAl is pleased to announce that your firm has
been certified as a Disadvantaged Business Enterprise [DBEI in Florida, under a
Unified Certification Program IUCPI in accordance with 49 CFR, PART 26.

DBE certification is continuing from the date of this letter, but is contingent upon the firm
renewing its eligibility annually through this office. You will be notified in advance of
your obligation to continue eligibility in a timely fashion. Failure to continue your
eligibility will result in immediate action to decertify the firm.

As long as the firm is listed in the DBE Directory, it is considered DBE Certified by all
Florida UCP Members.

DBE Certification is subject to actions by governmental agencies impacting the
disadvantaged status of the firm.

Your flrm will be listed in Florida's UCP DBE Directory which can be accessed via the
internet, at http://www.bipincwebapps.com/biznetflorida/ or through JAA's website at
http:llwuivv.iSa.aero/abouVdbe.asp and by "clicking" on "DBE Directory" in the left hand
margin, then "clicking" on "Diiectory" near the bottom of the page.

DBE certification is NOT a guarantee of work, but enables the firm to compete for, and
perform, contract work on all USDOT Federal Aid (FM, FTA and FHWA) projects in
Florida as a DBE contractor, sub-contractor, consultant, sub-consultant or material
supplier.

lf, at any time, there is a material change in the firm, including, but not limited to,
ownership, officers, Directors, scope of work being performed, daily operations,
affiliations with other businesses or individuals or physical location of the firm, you must
notify this office, in writing, without delay. Notification should include supporting
documentation, You will receive timely instruction from this office as to how you should
proceed, if necessary

Your firm may compete for, and perform, work on all USDOT Federal Aid projects
throughout Florida, receiving DBE credit for work performed in the following areas:

NAICS GODE: 332312: Fabricated Structural Metal Manufacturing

lf questions contact this office at (904) 741-2043 or via email at cboykin@aa.aero.

Sincerely,

Jachsonui l le Internat ional  Airport  .  Craig Airport  .  Her long Airport  .  Ceci l  Field


